



Central Lyon Community School

Serving Rock Rapids, Doon and Surrounding Area

1105 S. Story Street, P.O. Box 471

Rock Rapids, IA 51246

SPECIAL BOARD MEETING WEDNESDAY, APRIL 23 AT 5:30 P.M. CENTRAL LYON BOARD ROOM AGENDA

- I. Call Special Meeting to Order
 - Roll Call
 - Pledge of Allegiance
- II. Approve Agenda
- III. Reports
 - A. Discuss Adding Extracurricular Positions
 - a. MS Baseball Supervisor
 - b. MS Softball Supervisor
- IV. Old Business
 - A. Consider Purchasing School Supplies With Casino Funds
- V. New Business
 - A. Hiring
 - a. Natalie Larson, Kindergarten Teacher
 - b. Kate Gerber, Kindergarten Teacher (4th Section)
 - c. Geoff Kruse, .5 FTE Middle School Teacher in Conjunction With .5 Technology Integrationist
 - d. Kelly Weiler, Assistant Volleyball Coach
 - e. Ranita Nail, Football Cheerleading Advisor
 - f. Jessica Kruse, Competition Cheerleading Advisor
 - g. Jill Devitt, Individual Speech
 - B. Approve Reduction of Toby Lorenzen's Extended Contract
- VI. Enter into Closed Session Under Iowa Code 21.5 1 (i), Superintendent Evaluation
- VII. Other Business
- VIII. Announcements
- VI. Adjourn

The mission of the Central Lyon Community School District is to provide an education and the opportunity for all students to become productive, life-long learners.

School Supplies Quote for 2014-2015 School Year

Quantity

- 525 24 ct crayons, not twistables
- 525 twistable crayons, 24 ct.
- 150 5" scissors
- 150 6" scissor
- 180 7" scissors
- 980 Elmer's White Glue, 4 oz. bottle

4 Elmer's White Glue - gallon refill jugs

- 996 Erasers (small) 83 dozen small
- 4200 Pencils (ticonderoga) 350 doz.
- 525 washable markers (prang or Crayola 8 ct) Prang

525 washable markers (prang or Crayola 12 ct) Prang

525 Art box/bin (medium 10x9)

525 Art box/bin (large, 12x9)

140 12 ct large triangular 5.5 mm color pencils (Prang or Lyra) no twistables

385 12 ct large 5.5 mm color pencils (Prang or Lyra) no twistables

students

| | | |
|-----|----------------|--------------|
| 45 | PS | 73 students |
| 28 | TK | |
| 68 | K | 121 students |
| 53 | 1 | |
| 62 | 2 | 121 students |
| 59 | 3 | |
| 60 | 4 | |
| 46 | 5 | 160 students |
| 54 | 6 | |
| 475 | Total Students | |

525 Items

| Rock Scissors Paper | | Quill | | School Specialty | |
|---------------------|-------------|--------|-------------|------------------|-------------|
| Cost | Total | Cost | Total | Cost | Total |
| \$ 1.40 | \$ 735.00 | 1.19 | 624.75 | 1.45 | 761.25 |
| \$ 3.00 | \$ 1,575.00 | 2.63 | 1380.75 | 2.04 | 1071.00 |
| \$ 1.56 | \$ 234.00 | 1.43 | 214.5 | 0.49 | 73.50 |
| \$ 1.94 | \$ 291.00 | no bid | | 0.63 | 94.50 |
| \$ 2.35 | \$ 423.00 | 1.66 | 298.8 | 0.49 | 88.20 |
| \$ 0.77 | \$ 754.60 | 0.53 | 519.4 | 0.61 | 597.80 |
| \$ - | \$ - | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0.00 |
| \$ 0.16 | \$ 159.36 | 0.49 | 488.04 | | 43.96 |
| \$ 0.13 | \$ 546.00 | 0.08 | 336 | | 512.16 |
| \$ 2.23 | \$ 1,170.75 | 3.59 | 1884.75 | 2.85 | 1496.25 |
| \$ - | \$ - | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0.00 |
| \$ - | \$ - | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0.00 |
| \$ 4.50 | \$ 2,362.50 | no bid | | no bid | |
| \$ 3.05 | \$ 427.00 | 7.73 | 1082.2 | 3.36 | 470.40 |
| \$ 3.05 | \$ 1,174.25 | no bid | | no bid | |
| \$ - | \$ - | | | | |
| \$ - | \$ - | | | | |
| | \$ 9,852.46 | | \$ 6,829.19 | | \$ 5,209.02 |

| | |
|--------------------------------------|-------------|
| subtract art box cost for comparison | \$ 9,852.46 |
| 2362.50 | |
| \$ 7,489.96 | |



Central Lyon Community School

Serving Rock Rapids, Doon and Surrounding Area

1105 S. Story Street, P.O. Box 471

Rock Rapids, IA 51246

To: Central Lyon Board of Education

From: Dan Kruse

Date: 4/23/2014

Re: Hiring Recommendation

I recommend the hiring of Natalie Larson for one of our Kindergarten teaching positions. Mrs. Larson is currently teaching in North Dakota.

Five candidates were interviewed for this position. Mr. Harmon and Mrs. Boekhout served on the interview team with me.

Elementary/Middle School Principal



Central Lyon Community School

Serving Rock Rapids, Doon and Surrounding Area

1105 S. Story Street, P.O. Box 471

Rock Rapids, IA 51246

To: Central Lyon Board of Education

From: Dan Kruse

Date: 4/23/2014

Re: Hiring Recommendation

I recommend the hiring of Kate Gerber for our 4th Kindergarten teaching position. Mrs. Gerber currently teaches Kindergarten in Rochester, Minnesota.

Five candidates were interviewed for this position. Mr. Harmon and Mrs. Boekhout served on the interview team with me.

Elementary/Middle School Principal

Memorandum

To: Board of Education
From: Steve Harman, Assistant Principal/AD
Date: April 23, 2014
Re: Technology Integrationist/MS 6th Tech/Social Studies

A committee consisting of Bruce Eckenrod, Curtis Eben, and Steve Harman conducted a series of three interviews for the Technology Integrationist/MS Tech/Social Studies teacher. Mr. Kruse has seven years of experience in education and has been employed in this capacity in another district. It was determined from the interviews that Geoff Kruse was the best candidate for the combined position.

It is recommended that Geoff Kruse be hired as the Technology Integrationist/MS 6th Tech/Social Studies teacher.

Memorandum

To: Board of Education
From: Steve Harman, Assistant Principal/AD
Date: April 23, 2014
Re: Extra-Curricular Positions

Due to resignations we have several extra-curricular positions open. The following individuals have been interviewed and were found to meet the District's needs for these positions.

It is recommended the District hire the following individuals in the positions listed below:

- Kelly Weiler – Assistant Volleyball Coach
- Ranita Nail – Football Cheerleading Advisor
- Jessica Kruse – Competition Cheerleading Advisor
- Jill Devitt – Individual Speech Advisor

Memorandum

To: Central Lyon Board of Education
From: David Ackerman, Superintendent/HS Principal
Date: April 23, 2014
Re: Decrease Extended Contract

Due to Toby Lorenzen's transfer to full-time PE it is necessary to decrease his extended contract from 194 days to 191½.

It is recommended that Toby Lorenzen's contract be decreased to 191½ days for the 2014-2015 school year.